
 

GUNSMITHING THE AR-15​:  
BUILDING THE PERFORMANCE AR 

 
Master gunsmith and author Patrick 
Sweeney guides readers through 
more than a dozen projects that 
squeeze every ounce of performance 
out of an AR-15. Furthermore, 
Sweeney demystifies the large and 
often daunting accessory choices 
available today and educates 
shooters on what upgrades perform 
the best for specific ARs.  
 
Best of all, he breaks down 
upgrading an AR into a 
simple-to-follow, step-by-step 
process readers can complete in their 
own home with minimal tools. It’s no 
fuss gunsmithing that leaves 
shooters with a souped-up, hot-rod of 
a gun. 
 
Learn To Customize Your AR-15: 
➢ Competition:​ Learn what parts 
meet specifications and will help 
shooters outperform the competition 
➢ Hunting:​ Customize an AR for 
anything from predators to big game 
➢ Self-Defense:​ Understand the 
best setup for defense, and which 
modifications are unnecessary or 
even ill-advised 
➢ Retro:​ Learn to recreate 
historically accurate models 
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